
[[X47090 OMEGA]] VOLVO EC350EL 314507 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP402527
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: X47090 OMEGA

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lake CharlesPO BOX 16955LAKE CHARLES, LAUS  70616Contact: TINA LEDOUXtledoux@scottcompanies.comT: (337)433-9811F: (318)433-6623
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample. No correctiveaction is recommended at thistime.All metal levels are normalindicating no corrosion in the system.The water content is negligible. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the fuel. The condition of the fuelis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6244Unique No: 10536483Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 05886000 (Generated: 07/03/2023 10:42:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TINA LEDOUX - VOLVO6244

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP402527 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 512 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.36 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.003 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 05886000 (Generated: 07/03/2023 10:42:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TINA LEDOUX - VOLVO6244
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 314507\Diesel Fuel [VCP402527] 23 Jun 2023 @ 512.0 hrs

