
[[X17343 APAC]] VOLVO EC480EL 314326 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCE044468
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: X17343 APAC

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Jackson3860 I-55 SouthJACKSON, MSUS  39212Contact: EARL GUILBEAUeguilbeau@scottcompanies.comT: F: (601)326-3359
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The oil viscosity islower than normal. Confirm oil type.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid.

Depot: VOLVO8771Unique No: 10537035Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 06 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8771 [WUSCAR] 05886552 (Generated: 07/06/2023 11:09:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EARL GUILBEAU - VOLVO8771

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE044468 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4273 --- --- ---Oil Hours 4273 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 35.9 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.53 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 107679 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 21124 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 388 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/22/16 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 18 --- --- ---Copper ppm 9 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 13 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 500 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 553 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 467 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8771 [WUSCAR] 05886552 (Generated: 07/06/2023 11:09:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EARL GUILBEAU - VOLVO8771
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 314326\Hydraulic System [VCE044468] 27 Jun 2023 @ 4273.0 hrs

