
[[ALTA RENTS]] VOLVO A25G 752137 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP425278
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: ALTA RENTS

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: BRAD BYRObradley.byro@altg.comT: F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Appearance is milky.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10537423Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05886940 (Generated: 07/03/2023 14:54:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRAD BYRO - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP425278 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2899 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 311 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 5.41 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 115 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 143 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 39 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 105 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 923 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 150 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05886940 (Generated: 07/03/2023 14:54:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRAD BYRO - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752137\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP425278] 26 Jun 2023 @ 2899.0 hrs

