
SENNEBOGEN 835M 835.0.2888 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP398018
Oil Type: OIL PRO AW 68
Job No:

COMMERCIAL METALS COMPANY410 ATANDO AVECHARLOTTE, NCUS  28206Contact: JOHN PELOSOjohn.peloso@cmc.comT: (813)613-5034F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The filter change at thetime of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The amount and size ofparticulates present in the system areacceptable. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COMCHAVCUnique No: 10537866Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 06 Jul 2023
Report Id: COMCHAVC [WUSCAR] 05887383 (Generated: 07/06/2023 12:08:27) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP398018 VCP0007166 --- ---Sample Date 21 Jun 2023 04 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 3129 2462 --- ---Oil Hours 0 2462 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL ATTENTION --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 36.9 39.6 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 1.02 1.06 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 2113 9895 --- ---Particles >6µm 360 1661 --- ---Particles >14µm 43 39 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 18/16/13 20/18/12 --- ---Silicon ppm 6 4 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 7 --- ---Copper ppm 13 6 --- ---Lead ppm <1 2 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 1 --- ---Chromium ppm 3 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 817 1015 --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 8 --- ---Zinc ppm 605 574 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 486 497 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 1 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COMCHAVC [WUSCAR] 05887383 (Generated: 07/06/2023 12:08:30) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835M 835.0.2888\Hydraulic System [VCP398018] 21 Jun 2023 @ 3129.0 hrs

