
[[SW1013505 THRONDORED]] JCB 506C 1184387 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP406912
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SW1013505 THRONDORED

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10538583Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 04 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05888100 (Generated: 07/04/2023 15:38:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP406912 VCP342562 --- ---Sample Date 23 Jun 2023 03 Dec 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 51.8 174 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 2 2 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 1 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 121 41 --- ---Copper ppm 19 47 --- ---Lead ppm 50 46 --- ---Tin ppm 2 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 5 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 23 121 --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 3 --- ---Zinc ppm 20 85 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2584 978 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 95 85 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05888100 (Generated: 07/04/2023 15:38:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JCB JCB 506C 1184387\Rear Axle [VCP406912] 23 Jun 2023 @ .0 hrs

