
[[SW1013505 THRONDORED]] JCB 506C 1184387 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP397624
Oil Type: TDTO FLUID SAE 10W
Job No: SW1013505 THRONDORED

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level has decreased, but is stillabnormal. Clutch disc wear or oilcooler leaching indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10538599Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 04 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05888116 (Generated: 07/04/2023 15:41:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP397624 VCP342558 --- ---Sample Date 23 Jun 2023 03 Dec 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.2 40.2 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 7 7 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 28 58 --- ---Copper ppm 387 554 --- ---Lead ppm 0 2 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 1 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3330 2844 --- ---Magnesium ppm 9 10 --- ---Zinc ppm 1095 924 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 868 792 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 15 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05888116 (Generated: 07/04/2023 15:41:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JCB JCB 506C 1184387\Transmission [VCP397624] 23 Jun 2023 @ .0 hrs

