
[[18932 CONTI]] VOLVO A45G 352308 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP408024
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No: 18932 CONTI

2002 N GREENE STGREENVILLE, NCUS  27834Contact: BRANDON JENKINSBRANDON.JENKINS@ASCENDUMMACHINERY.COMT: F: (704)494-8197
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8769Unique No: 10538967Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 05 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05888484 (Generated: 07/05/2023 13:06:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408024 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2082 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 49.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 184 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 5 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 7 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 82 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 40 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2506 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 267 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05888484 (Generated: 07/05/2023 13:06:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352308\Rear Axle [VCP408024] 19 Jun 2023 @ 2082.0 hrs

