
[[57978 ENDURANCE]] VOLVO L110H 631866 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP0007150
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: 57978 ENDURANCE

114 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - CONCORD1025 INTERNATIONAL DR NWCONCORD, NCUS  28027Contact: JEFF WILBANKSjeff.wilbanks@ascendummachinery.comT: (704)599-8179F: (704)596-1362
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thealuminum level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0016Unique No: 10539932Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0016 [WUSCAR] 05889449 (Generated: 07/12/2023 13:22:24) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007150 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5973 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.66 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 4.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 78 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 1.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 90 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 66 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 22 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 53 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 23 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 59 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 25 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1981 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 519 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1434 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1144 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 27 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0016 [WUSCAR] 05889449 (Generated: 07/12/2023 13:22:30) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631866\Diesel Engine [VCP0007150] 29 Jun 2023 @ 5973.0 hrs

