
VOLVO A40G 340668 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP405994
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No:

SCHILDBERG CONSTRUCTION COMPANYPO BOX 358GREENFIELD, IAUS  50849Contact: SCOTT ARMSTRONGsarmstrong@schildberg.comT: (641)743-8237F: (641)743-2486
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: SCHGREUnique No: 10545757Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 05 Jul 2023
Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 05889947 (Generated: 07/07/2023 10:54:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP405994 VCP386179 VCP384415 VCP386554Sample Date 20 Jun 2023 10 May 2023 27 Mar 2023 28 Feb 2023Machine Hours 15839 15588 15225 15032Oil Hours 251 363 193 333Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.2 13.5 13.4 13.3Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.3 8.9 9.1 8.1Oxidation (PA) % 100 107 96 110
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.1 0.1 0.2Nitration (PA) % 76 93 83 100Sulfation (PA) % 70 73 70 76Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 5 6 7Sodium ppm 2 3 3 4Potassium ppm 1 3 <1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 10 8 14Copper ppm <1 <1 0 <1Lead ppm 0 2 0 2Tin ppm 0 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 1 2 <1 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 43 42 44 45Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1904 1884 1722 1893Magnesium ppm 574 572 537 533Zinc ppm 1044 1049 976 1017Phosphorus ppm 855 795 792 801Barium ppm 0 0 0 2Boron ppm 57 61 59 67

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 05889947 (Generated: 07/07/2023 10:54:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 340668\Diesel Engine [VCP405994] 20 Jun 2023 @ 15839.0 hrs

