
VOLVO A40G 341476 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP400074
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD PLUS 80W90
Job No:

SCHILDBERG CONSTRUCTION COMPANYPO BOX 358GREENFIELD, IAUS  50849Contact: SCOTT ARMSTRONGsarmstrong@schildberg.comT: (641)743-8237F: (641)743-2486
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SCHGREUnique No: 10546401Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Jul 2023
Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 05890591 (Generated: 07/07/2023 12:46:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP400074 VCP373802 VCP342167 VCP343272Sample Date 20 Jun 2023 09 Jan 2023 16 Sep 2022 25 Mar 2022Machine Hours 16355 15295 14679 13489Oil Hours 1060 616 1190 999Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 138 138 136 136
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm <1 2 1 2Sodium ppm 0 0 0 0Potassium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 6 5 13Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 0Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 0 <1Chromium ppm 0 <1 0 0Molybdenum ppm 1 1 1 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 <1Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 149 156 198 201Magnesium ppm 12 11 8 19Zinc ppm 59 70 89 96Phosphorus ppm 990 1000 954 1008Barium ppm 0 1 0 0Boron ppm 208 200 157 189

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 05890591 (Generated: 07/07/2023 12:46:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 341476\Rear Axle [VCP400074] 20 Jun 2023 @ 16355.0 hrs

