
VOLVO EC250EL 310111 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP379365
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD PLUS 80W90
Job No:

SCHILDBERG CONSTRUCTION COMPANYPO BOX 358GREENFIELD, IAUS  50849Contact: SCOTT ARMSTRONGsarmstrong@schildberg.comT: (641)743-8237F: (641)743-2486
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: SCHGREUnique No: 10546416Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Jul 2023
Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 05890606 (Generated: 07/07/2023 15:09:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP379365 VCP360988 VCP359528 VCP346019Sample Date 22 Jun 2023 01 Mar 2023 27 Oct 2022 12 May 2022Machine Hours 5368 5101 4840 4265Oil Hours 267 261 248 203Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION SEVERE ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 331 140 138 143
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 41 390 136 225Sodium ppm 2 8 5 5Potassium ppm 2 35 8 16
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 267 408 331 254Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 12 105 26 53Chromium ppm 2 5 4 3Molybdenum ppm 0 2 1 2Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 4 1 3Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 2 3 2 2Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 163 474 310 626Magnesium ppm <1 54 13 40Zinc ppm 103 71 114 228Phosphorus ppm 991 972 915 980Barium ppm 49 0 0 0Boron ppm 184 136 123 87

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 05890606 (Generated: 07/07/2023 15:10:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250EL 310111\Front Right Final Drive [VCP379365] 22 Jun 2023 @ 5368.0 hrs

