
[[3982HR]] VOLVO L180H 4673 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP405758
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 3982HR

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY CO MAINPO BOX 1957HARRISBURG, PAUS  17105Contact: BRANDON MIDDAUGHbmiddaugh@hwyequip.comT: F: (717)564-3568
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample. No correctiveaction is recommended at thistime.All metal levels are normalindicating no corrosion in the coolingsystem. The water content isnegligible. No coolant detected inthe sample. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0025Unique No: 10546494Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 07 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 05890684 (Generated: 07/07/2023 16:33:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON MIDDAUGH - VOLVO0025

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP405758 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10516 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.53 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.002 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 05890684 (Generated: 07/07/2023 16:33:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON MIDDAUGH - VOLVO0025
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 4673\Diesel Fuel [VCP405758] 29 Jun 2023 @ 10516.0 hrs

