
[[SPM566531]] VOLVO L220H 2822 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP415754
Oil Type: TDH FLUID SAE 75W80
Job No: SPM566531

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 10547411Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 07 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05891601 (Generated: 07/07/2023 22:00:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415754 VCP391329 VCP376549 VCP310198Sample Date 30 Jun 2023 20 Feb 2023 20 Jul 2022 14 Aug 2021Machine Hours 10936 10007 9117 7254Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A N/A N/A Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.0 42.0 45.8 43.2
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 12 11 11 8Sodium ppm 0 2 2 2Potassium ppm 2 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 275 252 206 145Copper ppm 7 6 7 7Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 1 <1 2 <1Chromium ppm 3 2 3 2Molybdenum ppm 2 2 2 2Nickel ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 4 4 4 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3164 2994 3232 3089Magnesium ppm 9 13 10 10Zinc ppm 1393 1195 1342 1299Phosphorus ppm 1264 1073 1208 1182Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 95 90 91 105

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05891601 (Generated: 07/07/2023 22:00:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 2822\Rear Axle [VCP415754] 30 Jun 2023 @ 10936.0 hrs

