
[[W07012979-1 BEASLEY]] VOLVO L90H 624938 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP327840
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: W07012979-1 BEASLEY

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC- RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10547505Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05891695 (Generated: 07/14/2023 07:27:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP327840 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4791 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 7 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.43 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.003 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05891695 (Generated: 07/14/2023 07:27:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624938\Diesel Fuel [VCP327840] 05 Jul 2023 @ 4791.0 hrs

