
VOLVO A40G 353302 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP414055
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

113 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GARNER3561 JONES SAUSAGE ROADGARNER, NCUS  27529Contact: TRENT BROADWELLtrent.broadwell@ascendummachinery.comT: (919)661-8817F: (919)661-9038
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasespecify the brand, type, and viscosityof the oil on your next sample.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0157Unique No: 10547683Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 08 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0157 [WUSCAR] 05891873 (Generated: 07/12/2023 13:23:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRENT BROADWELL - VOLVO0157

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414055 --- --- ---Sample Date 30 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1003 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.6 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 59 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 63 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 55 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 --- --- ---Copper ppm 45 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 62 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1155 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 887 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1206 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 997 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 7 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0157 [WUSCAR] 05891873 (Generated: 07/12/2023 13:24:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRENT BROADWELL - VOLVO0157
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 353302\Diesel Engine [VCP414055] 30 Jun 2023 @ 1003.0 hrs

