
[[CHARAH]] VOLVO A30G 752545 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP404933
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: CHARAH

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY  LLC - Springdale4831 NORTH THOMPSONSPRINGDALE, ARUS  72764Contact: DERRICK BRINKdbrink@scottcompanies.comT: (479)751-4242F: 
Diagnosis
We suspect abnormal contaminationmay be due to sampling method. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Cylinder,crank, or cam shaft wear is indicated.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: SCOSPRUnique No: 10547693Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 09 Jul 2023
Report Id: SCOSPR [WUSCAR] 05891883 (Generated: 07/09/2023 12:13:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DERRICK BRINK - SCOSPR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP404933 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 15.0 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 13 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 35 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 51 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 269 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2404 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 14 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 990 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1130 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 62 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSPR [WUSCAR] 05891883 (Generated: 07/09/2023 12:13:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DERRICK BRINK - SCOSPR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752545\Diesel Engine [VCP404933] 06 Jul 2023 @ .0 hrs

