
[[A10573]] VOLVO A35D 72130 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP425734
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: A10573

DYER QUARRYP.O. BOX 188, 1275 ROCK HOLLOW ROADBIRDSBORO, PAUS  19508Contact: MATT MCCLELLANDmatt.mcclelland@dyerquarry.comT: F: (610)582-2304
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: DYEBIRUnique No: 10547935Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 Jul 2023
Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 05892125 (Generated: 07/10/2023 12:34:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP425734 VCP372190 VCP335658 VCP314024Sample Date 27 Jun 2023 10 Jun 2022 27 Sep 2021 05 May 2021Machine Hours 12050 10833 10190 9575Oil Hours 500 0 500 2000Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.7 41.0 41.9 42.5Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.56 0.63 0.627 0.791
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 77241 98836 100453 169916Particles >6µm 1649 1267 1213 5713Particles >14µm 10 22 16 48ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/18/10 24/17/12 24/17/11 25/20/13Silicon ppm 11 9 8 8Sodium ppm 1 <1 2 <1Potassium ppm 2 2 <1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 30 27 23 26Copper ppm 31 22 18 13Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 2 3 2 <1Chromium ppm 8 4 2 <1Molybdenum ppm 3 3 3 3Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1376 1289 1346 1288Magnesium ppm 28 27 28 27Zinc ppm 853 806 794 775Phosphorus ppm 661 613 609 638Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 19 20 22 18

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 05892125 (Generated: 07/10/2023 12:34:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35D 72130\Hydraulic System [VCP425734] 27 Jun 2023 @ 12050.0 hrs

