
[[A10608]] VOLVO ECR235D 210265 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP425969
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 80W90
Job No: A10608

DYER QUARRYP.O. BOX 188, 1275 ROCK HOLLOW ROADBIRDSBORO, PAUS  19508Contact: MATT MCCLELLANDmatt.mcclelland@dyerquarry.comT: F: (610)582-2304
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Gear wear is indicated. Allother component wear rates arenormal. Elemental levels of silicon (Si)and aluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: DYEBIRUnique No: 10548313Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 Jul 2023
Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 05892503 (Generated: 07/10/2023 20:20:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP425969 VCP335655 VCBM001631 VCP257181Sample Date 27 Jun 2023 09 Nov 2021 01 Apr 2021 26 Mar 2020Machine Hours 7470 6940 6720 6180Oil Hours 500 1000 500 1000Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 151 153 312 304
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 80 45 111 189Sodium ppm 3 2 4 7Potassium ppm 3 2 3 12
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 706 348 541 489Copper ppm 2 <1 1 1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 2Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 14 8 20 47Chromium ppm 6 3 4 6Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 2 0Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 2 1 2 4Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 0Manganese ppm 6 3 4 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 25 100 46 74Magnesium ppm 4 4 10 17Zinc ppm 10 22 15 20Phosphorus ppm 1038 1054 893 808Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 204 171 149 123

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 05892503 (Generated: 07/10/2023 20:20:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235D 210265\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP425969] 27 Jun 2023 @ 7470.0 hrs

