
[[A10573]] VOLVO A35D 72130 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP425972
Oil Type: MOBIL GO 102
Job No: A10573

DYER QUARRYP.O. BOX 188, 1275 ROCK HOLLOW ROADBIRDSBORO, PAUS  19508Contact: MATT MCCLELLANDmatt.mcclelland@dyerquarry.comT: F: (610)582-2304
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: DYEBIRUnique No: 10548314Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 Jul 2023
Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 05892504 (Generated: 07/10/2023 20:24:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP425972 VCP372053 VCP334647 VCP308426Sample Date 27 Jun 2023 10 Jun 2022 27 Sep 2021 05 May 2021Machine Hours 12050 10833 10190 9575Oil Hours 500 0 500 2000Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 61.7 61.8 198 216
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 7 3 8 11Sodium ppm 3 2 0 3Potassium ppm 1 0 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 57 29 57 52Copper ppm 4 1 <1 3Lead ppm 5 2 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 3Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 1 3 3Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 45 66 91 62Magnesium ppm 2 0 5 17Zinc ppm 40 50 78 37Phosphorus ppm 2121 2015 1324 946Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 153 278 172 177

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 05892504 (Generated: 07/10/2023 20:24:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35D 72130\Drop Box [VCP425972] 27 Jun 2023 @ 12050.0 hrs

