
[[568171 ATLAS]] VOLVO L90H 623733 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP417243
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 568171 ATLAS

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10548319Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05892509 (Generated: 07/10/2023 20:32:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417243 VCP393592 VCP357376 VCP321512Sample Date 29 Jun 2023 28 Mar 2023 14 Apr 2022 07 Jul 2021Machine Hours 6673 11120 9196 7801Oil Hours 0 2000 2000 1800Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 33.3 58.5 46.9 47.2
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 13 15 10 7Sodium ppm 3 4 6 5Potassium ppm 2 1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 196 207 108 77Copper ppm 1 1 2 1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 1 <1Chromium ppm 3 3 2 1Molybdenum ppm 3 4 4 3Nickel ppm <1 <1 1 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm 7 3 2 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 661 3327 3233 2945Magnesium ppm 10 25 28 20Zinc ppm 287 1364 1223 1196Phosphorus ppm 415 1474 1376 1237Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 106 158 157 152

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05892509 (Generated: 07/10/2023 20:32:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 623733\Front Axle [VCP417243] 29 Jun 2023 @ 6673.0 hrs

