
[[SPM565669 AM TERM]] VOLVO L60H 622214 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP423140
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SPM565669 AM TERM

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. The oil change atthe time of sampling has been noted.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Aluminumppm levels are abnormal. Piston wearis indicated. There is a high amountof fuel present in the oil. Testsconfirm the presence of fuel in theoil. The BN result indicates that thereis suitable alkalinity remaining in theoil. Fuel is present in the oil and islowering the viscosity. The oil is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10548409Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05892599 (Generated: 07/11/2023 15:33:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423140 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1046 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 89 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.8 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 99 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 65 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 10.4 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 10 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 43 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 14 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 34 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1470 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 480 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1043 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 836 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 39 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05892599 (Generated: 07/11/2023 15:33:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622214\Diesel Engine [VCP423140] 13 Jun 2023 @ 1046.0 hrs

