
[[SPM566233]] SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2859 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP423159
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SPM566233

SIMS METAL MANAGEMENT2500 S. PAULINACHICAGO, ILUS  60608Contact: RYAN WISEryan.wise@simsmm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: SIMCHIILUnique No: 10548415Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05892605 (Generated: 07/11/2023 15:33:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423159 VCP404831 VCP390832 VCP379227Sample Date 13 Jun 2023 06 Apr 2023 12 Oct 2022 16 Jun 2022Machine Hours 4333 3781 2517 1647Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 12.8 13.2 13.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.6 7.9 8.0 8.0Oxidation (PA) % 89 69 88 78
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.3 0.2Nitration (PA) % 78 73 96 89Sulfation (PA) % 57 51 66 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.7 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 3 6 5Sodium ppm <1 <1 0 2Potassium ppm 2 <1 20 14
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 11 25 13Copper ppm 1 1 2 1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 1 7 5Chromium ppm <1 <1 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 62 54 55 56Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 2 2Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1090 828 1095 1174Magnesium ppm 1012 808 909 887Zinc ppm 1348 986 1178 1178Phosphorus ppm 1052 858 929 924Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 <1 12 14

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05892605 (Generated: 07/11/2023 15:33:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2859\Diesel Engine [VCP423159] 13 Jun 2023 @ 4333.0 hrs

