
[[SPM567536]] KOMATSU PC290LC A25486 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP404353
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SPM567536

JOHN KENO & CO750 RICARD LNELK GROVE VILLAGE, ILUS  60007Contact: LUKAS DECKERldecker@johnkeno.comT: (847)340-2432F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. There is a highamount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil. Theamount and size of particulatespresent in the system are acceptable.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: JOHELKUnique No: 10548659Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 10 Jul 2023
Report Id: JOHELK [WUSCAR] 05892849 (Generated: 07/10/2023 22:25:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LUKAS DECKER - JOHELK

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP404353 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5013 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.7 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.39 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 71560 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 6142 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 150 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/20/14 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 28 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 83 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 149 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 221 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JOHELK [WUSCAR] 05892849 (Generated: 07/10/2023 22:25:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LUKAS DECKER - JOHELK
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOMATSU KOMATSU PC290LC A25486\Hydraulic System [VCP404353] 26 Jun 2023 @ 5013.0 hrs

