
[[SPM566233]] SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2859 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP423191
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM566233

SIMS METAL MANAGEMENT2500 S. PAULINACHICAGO, ILUS  60608Contact: RYAN WISEryan.wise@simsmm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SIMCHIILUnique No: 10548877Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05893067 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:15:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423191 VCP404444 --- ---Sample Date 13 Jun 2023 06 Apr 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 4333 3781 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 192 184 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 22 2 --- ---Sodium ppm 4 9 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 213 309 --- ---Copper ppm 83 100 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 6 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 7 13 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2262 23 --- ---Magnesium ppm 62 6 --- ---Zinc ppm 876 143 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 986 1135 --- ---Barium ppm 80 241 --- ---Boron ppm 4 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05893067 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:15:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2859\Front Right Final Drive [VCP423191] 13 Jun 2023 @ 4333.0 hrs

