
[[SPM566233]] SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2859 - LEFT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP423160
Oil Type: SHELL 220
Job No: SPM566233

SIMS METAL MANAGEMENT2500 S. PAULINACHICAGO, ILUS  60608Contact: RYAN WISEryan.wise@simsmm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SIMCHIILUnique No: 10548894Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 10 Jul 2023
Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05893084 (Generated: 07/10/2023 15:29:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423160 VCP404162 VCP390835 VCP379234Sample Date 13 Jun 2023 06 Apr 2023 12 Oct 2022 16 Jun 2022Machine Hours 4333 3781 2517 1647Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 194 196 181 193
 CONTAMINATIONWater % --- --- 0.486 ---Silicon ppm 26 20 10 5Sodium ppm <1 1 0 0Potassium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 34 220 410 171Copper ppm 87 258 368 68Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm 5 24 36 5Aluminum ppm <1 1 2 <1Chromium ppm <1 1 3 1Molybdenum ppm 3 2 3 1Nickel ppm 0 <1 1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 2 4 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3010 2976 2498 1086Magnesium ppm 74 36 31 13Zinc ppm 1076 998 828 415Phosphorus ppm 887 878 840 534Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 3 7 20 25

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05893084 (Generated: 07/10/2023 15:29:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2859\Left Swing Drive [VCP423160] 13 Jun 2023 @ 4333.0 hrs

