
VOLVO A25G 742123 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP415660
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No:

215 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - CAYCE2303 AIRPORT BLVDCAYCE, SCUS  29033Contact: ROBBY HERLONGrobby.herlong@ascendummachinery.comT: (803)394-6783F: (803)791-9920
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0013Unique No: 10548927Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 05893117 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:31:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBBY HERLONG - VOLVO0013

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415660 VCP415512 --- ---Sample Date 05 Jul 2023 22 Jun 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 0 5812 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd N/A --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 100 100 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 18 25 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 2 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 79 101 --- ---Copper ppm 79 69 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 2 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 1 1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 1 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 171 218 --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 157 143 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1303 1373 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 209 237 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 05893117 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:31:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBBY HERLONG - VOLVO0013
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 742123\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP415660] 05 Jul 2023 @ .0 hrs

