
VOLVO A25G 742123 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP415656
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No:

215 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - CAYCE2303 AIRPORT BLVDCAYCE, SCUS  29033Contact: GARY MARTINGARY.MARTIN@ASCENDUMMACHINERY.COMT: (803)727-9615F: (803)791-9920
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Weadvise that you inspect for thesource(s) of metal. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Highconcentration of visible metalpresent. All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0013Unique No: 10548928Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 05893118 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:53:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GARY MARTIN - VOLVO0013

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415656 VCP415504 VCP238877 ---Sample Date 05 Jul 2023 22 Jun 2023 10 May 2019 ---Machine Hours 0 5812 581 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd N/A Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 107 104 61.6 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 86 59 4 ---Sodium ppm 3 2 5 ---Potassium ppm 2 4 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 226 146 121 ---Copper ppm 11 12 16 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 15 7 <1 ---Chromium ppm 3 2 4 ---Molybdenum ppm 2 2 5 ---Nickel ppm 2 2 2 ---Titanium ppm 2 1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 4 3 12 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 88 90 35 ---Magnesium ppm 27 25 0 ---Zinc ppm 71 60 8 ---Phosphorus ppm 1287 1423 1264 ---Barium ppm <1 0 0 ---Boron ppm 395 368 175 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 05893118 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:53:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GARY MARTIN - VOLVO0013
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 742123\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP415656] 05 Jul 2023 @ .0 hrs

