
VOLVO A25G 742123 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP415654
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

215 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - CAYCE2303 AIRPORT BLVDCAYCE, SCUS  29033Contact: ROBBY HERLONGrobby.herlong@ascendummachinery.comT: (803)394-6783F: (803)791-9920
Diagnosis
We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of metal. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Highconcentration of visible metalpresent. All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0013Unique No: 10548930Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 05893120 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:31:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBBY HERLONG - VOLVO0013

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415654 VCP415507 VCP148030 ---Sample Date 05 Jul 2023 22 Jun 2023 10 May 2019 ---Machine Hours 0 5812 581 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed N/A N/A Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 101 101 62.2 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 33 34 1 ---Sodium ppm 3 2 3 ---Potassium ppm <1 4 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 128 139 121 ---Copper ppm 66 62 11 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 2 3 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 4 3 <1 ---Chromium ppm 2 2 3 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 3 ---Nickel ppm 2 2 1 ---Titanium ppm 1 1 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 2 3 11 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 237 274 36 ---Magnesium ppm 5 3 0 ---Zinc ppm 154 167 6 ---Phosphorus ppm 1281 1408 1274 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 319 313 177 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 05893120 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:31:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBBY HERLONG - VOLVO0013
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 742123\Rear Axle [VCP415654] 05 Jul 2023 @ .0 hrs

