
[[2523-1]] VOLVO L90F 3199 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP407763
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No: 2523-1

MCCLUNG LOGAN17941 SUSSEX HIGHWAYBRIDGEVILLE, DEUS  19933Contact: RANDY KINGrking@mcclung-logan.comT: (302)337-3400F: (302)337-9083
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO1023Unique No: 10548936Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1023 [WUSCAR] 05893126 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:35:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY KING - VOLVO1023

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407763 VCP390160 VCP380621 VCP346499Sample Date 28 Jun 2023 28 Mar 2023 13 Dec 2022 17 Feb 2022Machine Hours 16948 16484 15806 13800Oil Hours 0 0 0 2000Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.8 43.0 44.2 42.0
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 13 13 14 40Sodium ppm 3 3 7 10Potassium ppm 0 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 6 7 65Copper ppm 0 0 0 <1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 1 1 1 5Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3825 4069 4047 4290Magnesium ppm 21 20 19 26Zinc ppm 1497 1562 1587 1663Phosphorus ppm 1230 1247 1236 1396Barium ppm 0 0 <1 0Boron ppm 170 144 134 149

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1023 [WUSCAR] 05893126 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:35:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY KING - VOLVO1023
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90F 3199\Front Axle [VCP407763] 28 Jun 2023 @ 16948.0 hrs

