
[[SPM566281]] VOLVO L150H 6938 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP423134
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: SPM566281

SIMS METAL MANAGEMENT2500 S. PAULINACHICAGO, ILUS  60608Contact: RYAN WISEryan.wise@simsmm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: SIMCHIILUnique No: 10548942Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05893132 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:16:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423134 VCP410975 VCP372554 VCP358242Sample Date 14 Jun 2023 04 Apr 2023 23 Aug 2022 19 Mar 2022Machine Hours 9087 5815 6938 3104Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 29.0 29.1 29.2 32.0
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 5 9 10Sodium ppm 3 2 4 5Potassium ppm 0 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 29 28 63 56Copper ppm 30 31 122 14Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 1 1Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 2 <1 0Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 1 <1Manganese ppm 1 2 4 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 170 182 366 88Magnesium ppm 23 24 3 3Zinc ppm 80 63 148 20Phosphorus ppm 212 222 274 204Barium ppm <1 0 5 0Boron ppm 79 70 90 71

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05893132 (Generated: 07/11/2023 12:16:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6938\Transmission (Auto) [VCP423134] 14 Jun 2023 @ 9087.0 hrs

