
VOLVO A45G 342540 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP0007584
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

QGS - QUALITY GRASSES SERV/TCF LEASING17502 CR 672LITHIA, FLUS  33547Contact: GARY ROGERSgrogers@qgsdevelopment.comT: (813)323-4119F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 40Diesel Engine Oil.  Please confirm theoil type and grade, and specify thebrand of the oil on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: QUALITFLUnique No: 10548994Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: QUALITFL [WUSCAR] 05893184 (Generated: 07/12/2023 11:33:24) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007584 VCP344362 VCP299459 VCP301583Sample Date 06 Jul 2023 09 Nov 2021 10 May 2021 12 Feb 2021Machine Hours 0 4094 3551 3069Oil Hours 0 500 500 500Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.6 12.9 12.7 12.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 59 84 83 83
 CONTAMINATIONWater % --- --- 0.102 ---Soot % % 0.2 0.3 0.2 0.3Nitration (PA) % 58 67 67 66Sulfation (PA) % 53 63 65 64Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 5 4 5Sodium ppm <1 2 3 0Potassium ppm 2 <1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 8 6 9Copper ppm 1 2 2 8Lead ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 0 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 62 41 43 45Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1692 1695 1698 1864Magnesium ppm 542 510 516 493Zinc ppm 1328 1073 1095 1138Phosphorus ppm 1108 966 949 1048Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 1 34 57 35

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: QUALITFL [WUSCAR] 05893184 (Generated: 07/12/2023 11:33:27) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342540\Diesel Engine [VCP0007584] 06 Jul 2023 @ .0 hrs

