
VOLVO A45G 342538 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP0007977
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No:

QGS - QUALITY GRASSES SERV/TCF LEASING17502 CR 672LITHIA, FLUS  33547Contact: GARY ROGERSgrogers@qgsdevelopment.comT: (813)323-4119F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Additivelevels indicate the addition of adifferent brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: QUALITFLUnique No: 10549882Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: QUALITFL [WUSCAR] 05894072 (Generated: 07/12/2023 11:31:29) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007977 VCP360251 VCP334709 VCP266250Sample Date 06 Jul 2023 12 Apr 2022 03 Aug 2021 27 Apr 2020Machine Hours 0 5233 4214 2052Oil Hours 0 1000 1500 2052Oil Changed N/A Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL ATTENTION SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 177 251 210 57.1
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 12 7 5 43Sodium ppm 0 1 <1 12Potassium ppm 2 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 222 732 29 120Copper ppm 3 6 2 9Lead ppm 0 <1 0 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 5 0 28Chromium ppm 2 7 <1 2Molybdenum ppm 4 7 5 10Nickel ppm 2 6 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 13 <1 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2851 132 159 70Magnesium ppm 19 24 6 2Zinc ppm 997 66 62 103Phosphorus ppm 1040 855 1023 2685Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 93 87 106 144

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: QUALITFL [WUSCAR] 05894072 (Generated: 07/12/2023 11:31:33) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342538\Drop Box [VCP0007977] 06 Jul 2023 @ .0 hrs

