
[[S631 IAA RANCHO CORD]] VOLVO L90H 623903 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP425897
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: S631 IAA RANCHO CORD

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT8594 FRUITRIDGE ROADSACRAMENTO, CAUS  95826Contact: RAY KRANZUSCHray.kranzusch@vcesvolvo.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4485Unique No: 10550526Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4485 [WUSCAR] 05894716 (Generated: 07/11/2023 14:39:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RAY KRANZUSCH - VOLVO4485

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP425897 VCP266923 VCP247114 VCP219149Sample Date 06 Jul 2023 10 Apr 2020 26 Jul 2019 08 May 2018Machine Hours 10036 5960 4590 2031Oil Hours 0 0 0 500Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.0 40.5 43.0 40.87
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 25 20 16 14Sodium ppm 10 6 0 0Potassium ppm 2 0 1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 77 78 106 200Copper ppm 6 16 27 42Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 3 2Aluminum ppm 5 3 2 1Chromium ppm <1 1 2 6Molybdenum ppm <1 0 <1 3Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 1 3 9Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3911 4284 3785 4007Magnesium ppm 17 13 11 16Zinc ppm 1665 1714 1492 1508Phosphorus ppm 1353 1312 1241 1263Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 124 127 132 107

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4485 [WUSCAR] 05894716 (Generated: 07/11/2023 14:39:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RAY KRANZUSCH - VOLVO4485
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 623903\Rear Axle [VCP425897] 06 Jul 2023 @ 10036.0 hrs

