
[[565509]] VOLVO A30G 752905 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP424507
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 565509

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: ROBERT TURNERrturner@ripatampa.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.The copper level hasdecreased, but is still abnormal. Allother component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10550574Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 12 Jul 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05894764 (Generated: 07/12/2023 16:21:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424507 VCP397487 --- ---Sample Date 13 Jun 2023 22 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1294 537 --- ---Oil Hours 500 500 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.7 10.6 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.3 5.7 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 84 60 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 1 0.7 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 92 88 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 67 59 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 0.5 --- ---Silicon ppm 9 64 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 5 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 25 45 --- ---Copper ppm 104 382 --- ---Lead ppm 2 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 2 4 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 4 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 50 92 --- ---Nickel ppm 1 2 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm <1 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 7 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1722 2354 --- ---Magnesium ppm 395 17 --- ---Zinc ppm 1035 1201 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 834 1027 --- ---Barium ppm 0 2 --- ---Boron ppm 15 20 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05894764 (Generated: 07/12/2023 16:21:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752905\Diesel Engine [VCP424507] 13 Jun 2023 @ 1294.0 hrs

