
[[568198]] VOLVO A30G 752866 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP422142
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 568198

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: ROBERT TURNERrturner@ripatampa.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The copper level hasdecreased, but is still abnormal. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10550577Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05894767 (Generated: 07/11/2023 17:11:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422142 VCP402963 --- ---Sample Date 05 Jul 2023 13 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1096 526 --- ---Oil Hours 500 526 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status MARGINAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 10.8 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.7 6.2 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 77 59 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.4 0.3 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 72 82 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 63 54 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 0.6 --- ---Silicon ppm 7 46 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 4 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 27 --- ---Copper ppm 123 398 --- ---Lead ppm 1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 52 85 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 4 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm <1 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 6 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1698 2118 --- ---Magnesium ppm 394 134 --- ---Zinc ppm 1041 1210 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 845 1030 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 28 24 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05894767 (Generated: 07/11/2023 17:11:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752866\Diesel Engine [VCP422142] 05 Jul 2023 @ 1096.0 hrs

