
[[565152 MOSAIC]] VOLVO A40G 342363 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP411588
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 565152 MOSAIC

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAJFARDELLA@ALTAEQUIPFL.COMT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Anincrease in the copper level is noted.All other component wear rates arenormal. The amount and size ofparticulates present in the system areacceptable. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Additivelevels indicate the addition of adifferent brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10550753Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 12 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05894943 (Generated: 07/12/2023 14:58:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP411588 VCP378027 VCP340264 VCP269709Sample Date 05 Jun 2023 22 Jun 2022 26 Oct 2021 27 Feb 2020Machine Hours 7605 5980 4925 0Oil Hours 3000 2000 1500 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.8 41.9 40.6 41.3Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.90 0.40 0.396 0.602
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 32170 17548 12181 10040Particles >6µm 3414 7566 3420 1899Particles >14µm 121 1162 269 73ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/19/14 21/20/17 21/19/15 21/18/13Silicon ppm 16 5 7 7Sodium ppm 2 <1 3 2Potassium ppm 2 0 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 8 10 4Copper ppm 124 6 9 6Lead ppm 0 3 5 2Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 2 <1 2 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 2 <1 0Nickel ppm 2 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3978 108 71 52Magnesium ppm 12 10 3 2Zinc ppm 1594 448 459 440Phosphorus ppm 1319 360 354 310Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 125 1 7 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05894943 (Generated: 07/12/2023 14:59:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342363\Hydraulic System [VCP411588] 05 Jun 2023 @ 7605.0 hrs

