
[[565509]] VOLVO A30G 752905 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP407832
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 565509

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: ROBERT TURNERrturner@ripatampa.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. Thisplus the additive levels indicates theaddition of a different brand, or typeof oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10551173Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05895363 (Generated: 07/13/2023 13:44:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407832 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1244 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1244 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 47.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 28 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 79 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 13 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 12 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 39 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 35 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2444 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 181 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05895363 (Generated: 07/13/2023 13:44:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752905\Drop Box [VCP407832] 13 Jun 2023 @ 1244.0 hrs

