
[[566012]] VOLVO L110H 632272 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP398025
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 566012

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: ROBERT TURNERrturner@ripatampa.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Weadvise that you check for the sourceof water entry. The oil change at thetime of sampling has been noted. Weadvise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. There is ahigh concentration of water presentin the oil. The oil viscosity is higherthan normal. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10551190Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05895380 (Generated: 07/13/2023 11:43:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP398025 VCP386604 --- ---Sample Date 20 Jun 2023 30 Nov 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 2490 1193 --- ---Oil Hours 1490 1500 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 1109 40.6 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 36.2 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 1015 27 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 10 --- ---Potassium ppm 9 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2540 164 --- ---Copper ppm 5 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 5 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 198 1 --- ---Chromium ppm 34 5 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 10 --- ---Nickel ppm 18 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 9 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 22 11 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1673 4179 --- ---Magnesium ppm 79 13 --- ---Zinc ppm 844 1594 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 729 1304 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 20 145 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05895380 (Generated: 07/13/2023 11:43:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 632272\Rear Axle [VCP398025] 20 Jun 2023 @ 2490.0 hrs

