
[[566115 TUCKER PAVING]] VOLVO EC380EL 314448 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP396857
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 566115 TUCKER PAVING

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAJFARDELLA@ALTAEQUIPFL.COMT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10551191Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05895381 (Generated: 07/13/2023 11:45:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP396857 VCP341470 VCP351188 VCP318115Sample Date 15 Jun 2023 29 Aug 2022 12 Jan 2022 09 Sep 2021Machine Hours 3267 2121 1186 640Oil Hours 1000 1000 500 640Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 233 236 164 165
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 72 11 16 11Sodium ppm <1 0 3 3Potassium ppm 1 1 1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 463 96 205 170Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm 2 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 8 2 3 1Chromium ppm 12 3 5 4Molybdenum ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 2 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 5 1 3 3Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 31 46 13 12Magnesium ppm 5 5 3 1Zinc ppm 78 89 24 19Phosphorus ppm 837 949 309 296Barium ppm 0 3 0 0Boron ppm 65 99 1 10

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05895381 (Generated: 07/13/2023 11:45:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380EL 314448\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP396857] 15 Jun 2023 @ 3267.0 hrs

