
[[302924]] VOLVO L90G 617783 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP417405
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 302924

COVANTA LAKES3830 ROGERS INDUSTRIAL PARK ROADOKAHUMPKA, FLUS  32762Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Appearance is hazy.There is a light concentration ofwater present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COVOKAUnique No: 10551208Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: COVOKA [WUSCAR] 05895398 (Generated: 07/14/2023 13:30:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - COVOKA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417405 VCP355023 VCP378864 VCP301970Sample Date 06 Jul 2023 15 Dec 2022 24 May 2022 06 Jan 2021Machine Hours 11536 11049 10496 9508Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.0 39.8 40.1 40.2
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.330 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 20 12 12 11Sodium ppm 5 8 6 8Potassium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 99 73 52 29Copper ppm 2 6 2 1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 4 2 2 <1Chromium ppm 2 1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 2 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 2 1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4101 3898 3826 4000Magnesium ppm 29 19 18 18Zinc ppm 1711 1524 1576 1561Phosphorus ppm 1312 1211 1205 1261Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 134 126 140 125

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COVOKA [WUSCAR] 05895398 (Generated: 07/14/2023 13:30:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - COVOKA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90G 617783\Front Axle [VCP417405] 06 Jul 2023 @ 11536.0 hrs

