
[[566237 NA MINING]] VOLVO L180H 004502 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP424501
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: 566237 NA MINING

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAJFARDELLA@ALTAEQUIPFL.COMT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10551227Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05895417 (Generated: 07/13/2023 11:45:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424501 VCP393943 VCP353520 VCP354167Sample Date 14 Jun 2023 06 Mar 2023 26 Aug 2022 01 Jun 2022Machine Hours 10570 10109 8634 7886Oil Hours 500 2000 2000 2000Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL SEVERE SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.8 27.6 26.2 26.3
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 4 6 5Sodium ppm 2 2 1 2Potassium ppm <1 3 2 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 224 189 580 490Copper ppm 4 3 10 8Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 <1 3 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 2 4 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 82 88 121 116Magnesium ppm 2 7 14 14Zinc ppm 0 0 33 31Phosphorus ppm 199 198 213 177Barium ppm 0 0 3 0Boron ppm 77 76 57 64

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05895417 (Generated: 07/13/2023 11:45:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 004502\Transmission (Auto) [VCP424501] 14 Jun 2023 @ 10570.0 hrs

