
VOLVO A45G 353267 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP420085
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No:

LEE MAR BUILDING & CONSTRUCTION15685 PINE RIDGE ROADFORT MYERS, FLUS  33908-2626Contact: JUDY GIBSONjgibson13@earthlink.netT: (239)481-2613F: (239)481-9354
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Copper and iron ppmlevels are abnormal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: LEEFORUnique No: 10551618Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: LEEFOR [WUSCAR] 05895808 (Generated: 07/13/2023 12:59:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUDY GIBSON - LEEFOR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420085 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1257 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 20 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 31 --- --- ---Copper ppm 155 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 6 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3785 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1593 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1308 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 133 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEEFOR [WUSCAR] 05895808 (Generated: 07/13/2023 12:59:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUDY GIBSON - LEEFOR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353267\Wet Disc Brake [VCP420085] 10 Jul 2023 @ 1257.0 hrs

