
VOLVO A45G 352367 - A45G - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP420174
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10551619Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05895809 (Generated: 07/13/2023 12:59:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420174 VCP348927 --- ---Sample Date 10 Jul 2023 24 Jan 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 1257 2161 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.3 40.2 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 22 23 --- ---Sodium ppm 5 66 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 29 48 --- ---Copper ppm 161 114 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 1 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 8 6 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 1 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3248 3813 --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 11 --- ---Zinc ppm 1462 1486 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1277 1362 --- ---Barium ppm 2 0 --- ---Boron ppm 109 121 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05895809 (Generated: 07/13/2023 12:59:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352367 - A45G\Wet Disc Brake [VCP420174] 10 Jul 2023 @ 1257.0 hrs

