
VOLVO EC380 314840 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP415808
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Chromium ppm levels aresevere. Iron ppm levels are abnormal.Gear wear is indicated. There is amoderate concentration of dirtpresent in the oil. High amount ofingressed dirt has caused abrasivewear to the component. The oil is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10551620Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05895810 (Generated: 07/13/2023 12:59:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415808 VCP395869 VCP363893 ---Sample Date 06 Jul 2023 31 Jan 2023 27 Aug 2022 ---Machine Hours 3195 1849 1084 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 264 238 163 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 106 53 16 ---Sodium ppm 0 2 0 ---Potassium ppm 2 1 2 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 716 275 342 ---Copper ppm 2 <1 <1 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm 12 5 4 ---Chromium ppm 21 12 7 ---Molybdenum ppm 8 8 <1 ---Nickel ppm 2 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 <1 0 ---Manganese ppm 7 4 6 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 142 113 30 ---Magnesium ppm 32 33 1 ---Zinc ppm 95 79 16 ---Phosphorus ppm 1024 862 269 ---Barium ppm 2 0 3 ---Boron ppm 171 112 <1 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05895810 (Generated: 07/13/2023 12:59:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380 314840\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP415808] 06 Jul 2023 @ 3195.0 hrs

