
VOLVO L110H 631239 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP407844
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: ROBERT TURNERrturner@ripatampa.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Light fuel dilutionoccurring. Fuel is present in the oiland is lowering the viscosity. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10551660Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05895850 (Generated: 07/14/2023 01:07:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407844 VCP381372 VCP390705 VCP336906Sample Date 27 Jun 2023 09 Feb 2023 25 Oct 2022 18 Nov 2021Machine Hours 9267 8759 8302 7089Oil Hours 500 500 500 1500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.6 12.7 13.2 13.3Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.1 10.1 11.7 10.6Oxidation (PA) % 78 82 91 80
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.3 0.4 0.3Nitration (PA) % 66 63 80 71Sulfation (PA) % 58 61 65 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 3.7 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 3 3 6 5Sodium ppm 2 <1 3 4Potassium ppm 2 2 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 12 16 10Copper ppm 4 1 2 1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 6 7 11 5Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 50 45 43 47Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2008 1659 1766 1767Magnesium ppm 543 485 531 456Zinc ppm 1284 1122 1147 1094Phosphorus ppm 1082 917 945 926Barium ppm 12 2 0 0Boron ppm 61 32 26 32

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05895850 (Generated: 07/14/2023 01:07:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631239\Diesel Engine [VCP407844] 27 Jun 2023 @ 9267.0 hrs

