
[[SWA-304265-10 TOEPE]] VOLVO EC950F 410101 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP398127
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SWA-304265-10 TOEPE

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PATRICK FRYpatrick.fry@altg.comT: (248)378-3117F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. The oil change atthe time of sampling has been noted.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is a highamount of fuel present in the oil. Fuelis present in the oil and is loweringthe viscosity. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10551691Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05895881 (Generated: 07/13/2023 22:35:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PATRICK FRY - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP398127 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 172 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 3.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 46 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 77 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 47 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 40.8 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 24 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 --- --- ---Copper ppm 9 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 48 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1378 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 12 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 701 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 601 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 31 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05895881 (Generated: 07/13/2023 22:35:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PATRICK FRY - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC950F 410101\Diesel Engine [VCP398127] 07 Jul 2023 @ 172.0 hrs

