
[[SPM579077]] VOLVO EC750E 314043 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP417620
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: SPM579077

BLUE GOOSE GROWERS16059 W ORANGE AVEFT PIERCE, FLUS  34945Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (772)461-3020F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. Elemental levels ofsilicon (Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: BLUFORUnique No: 10552329Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: BLUFOR [WUSCAR] 05896519 (Generated: 07/13/2023 22:14:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - BLUFOR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417620 VCP406137 VCP395867 VCP369795Sample Date 05 Jul 2023 20 Apr 2023 07 Feb 2023 28 Nov 2022Machine Hours 3974 3513 2974 2449Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 241 236 239 236
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 201 202 216 177Sodium ppm 2 2 2 2Potassium ppm <1 2 3 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1264 1135 1094 773Copper ppm 0 3 3 2Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 18 18 19 17Chromium ppm 10 10 10 8Molybdenum ppm 6 6 7 6Nickel ppm 2 2 3 1Titanium ppm 1 1 1 1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 10 10 9 7Vanadium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 130 139 161 142Magnesium ppm 27 33 34 30Zinc ppm 75 80 86 75Phosphorus ppm 838 824 829 823Barium ppm 2 6 7 7Boron ppm 87 96 113 95

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BLUFOR [WUSCAR] 05896519 (Generated: 07/13/2023 22:14:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - BLUFOR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC750E 314043\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP417620] 05 Jul 2023 @ 3974.0 hrs

