
[[19096]] VOLVO A45G 353355 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP426887
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 19096

GAINES & CO526 THREE SISTERS RDKNIGHTDALE, NCUS  27545Contact: BEAR PERONEgperone@gainesandco.comT: (919)524-4711F: (919)944-0091
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: GAIKNIUnique No: 10552478Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Jul 2023
Report Id: GAIKNI [WUSCAR] 05896668 (Generated: 07/14/2023 10:59:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEAR PERONE - GAIKNI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426887 VCP425604 --- ---Sample Date 07 Jul 2023 03 Apr 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 946 558 --- ---Oil Hours 388 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.6 10.6 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.7 6.0 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 57 58 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.2 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 55 80 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 54 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 7 28 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 22 --- ---Copper ppm 58 280 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 1 4 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 3 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 66 90 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 3 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1208 2315 --- ---Magnesium ppm 772 18 --- ---Zinc ppm 1207 1265 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1027 1057 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 9 55 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GAIKNI [WUSCAR] 05896668 (Generated: 07/14/2023 10:59:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEAR PERONE - GAIKNI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353355\Diesel Engine [VCP426887] 07 Jul 2023 @ 946.0 hrs

