
[RALIEGH, NC/ASCENDUM MACHINERY SERVICE AGREEMENT [19116]] VOLVO L90H 623127 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP418156
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 19116

IAA - INSURANCE AUTO AUCTIONS - CLAYTON60 SADISCO RDCLAYTON, NCUS  27520Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: INSCLAUnique No: 10552833Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Jul 2023
Report Id: INSCLA [WUSCAR] 05897023 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:11:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - INSCLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418156 VCP411468 VCP359106 VCP323133Sample Date 03 Jul 2023 28 Feb 2023 28 Jun 2022 27 Dec 2021Machine Hours 9812 9110 7986 7291Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed N/ASample Status MARGINAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.4 43.0 42.5 43.6
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.372 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 51 25 33 34Sodium ppm 6 3 12 6Potassium ppm 0 3 0 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 257 196 171 156Copper ppm 9 12 2 2Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 2 0 <1Aluminum ppm 12 5 4 6Chromium ppm 3 2 2 2Molybdenum ppm 4 4 1 <1Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 1 2 2 2Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3919 4249 4185 3951Magnesium ppm 22 23 19 17Zinc ppm 1664 1669 1623 1553Phosphorus ppm 1307 1342 1340 1289Barium ppm 0 0 <1 0Boron ppm 137 139 133 140

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: INSCLA [WUSCAR] 05897023 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:11:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - INSCLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 623127\Rear Axle [VCP418156] 03 Jul 2023 @ 9812.0 hrs

