
[[X58161]] VOLVO ECR235EL 311537 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP322936
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: X58161

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Saint RosePO BOX 997SAINT ROSE, LAUS  70087Contact: DENISE CORVERSdcorvers@scottcompanies.comT: (504)461-0961F: (504)461-0970
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The oil isno longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: SCOSAIUnique No: 10552840Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Jul 2023
Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 05897030 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:17:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DENISE CORVERS - SCOSAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP322936 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4049 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 224 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.252 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 1558 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 31 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 65 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5342 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 186 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 79 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 9 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 8 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 48 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 115 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 25 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 21 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 376 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 05897030 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:17:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DENISE CORVERS - SCOSAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235EL 311537\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP322936] 07 Jul 2023 @ 4049.0 hrs

